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MAIN TOPICS  

 
 
 

 
PELVIC FLOOR: ANATOMY  

PELVIC FLOOR: NEUROPHISIOLOGY  

IMAGING IN PELVIC FLOOR DISORDERS 

PELVIC CHRONIC PAIN  

CONSTIPATION 

LAPAROSCOPY AND PELVIPERINEAL SURGERY  

MAKING TERMS IN UROGYNECOLOGY AND COLOPROCTOLOGY 

MESH AND PELVIPERINEAL SURGERY  

PELVIC FLOOR:  RESEARCH, INNOVATIONS AND CONTINUAL MEDICAL EDUCATION  

URO-FECAL INCONTINENCE  

RECTAL PROLAPSE 

LIVE SURGERY 

 



 

 

Conference Hall , 7 October  2010  
 
SESSION ONE  
 
Time  TOPICS  
08.30 Surgical Anatomy- 

NEUROPHISIOLOGY 
 

 Anatomy lecture:  
Rectoanal View 

 

 Anatomy lecture: 
Urogynecological View 

 

 Surgery and anatomy of 
pelvic floor: new approach 

 

 Basic in neurophisiology  
 Discussion  

09.30 MAKING TERMS IN 
UROGYNECOLOGY AND 
COLOPROCTOLOGY 

 

 Current terminology  
 Mterms coloprocto  
 Mterms urogyne  
 Final document  
 Discussion  

10.30 COFFEE BREAK  
11.00 SALUTO- 

PRESENTAZIONE  
 

 Pres regione o Altro  
 Pres Siucp  
 Pres ACOI, SIC, AIUG  

11.30 PELVIC FLOOR:  
RESEARCH, 
INNOVATIONS AND 
CONTINUAL MEDICAL 
EDUCATION 

 

 State of art and EBM  
 Research and innovation : 

new perspectives 
 

 Organization  in pelvic floor 
disorders 

 

 Continual medical education 
: role of a dedicated center 

 

 Discussion  
12.30 IMAGING IN PELVIC 

FLOOR DISORDERS 
 

 Pelvic floor endosonography  
 Rectal Ultrasound  
 Cinedefecography  
 DefecoRMN  
 Discussion  

13.30 LUNCH  
 



 

 
SESSION TWO  

 
14.30 DOLORE PELVICO 

CRONICO 
 

 State of art and EBM  
 Pain after surgery  
 New medical and mini-

invasive technique in pain 
 

 New surgical technique in 
pain 

 

 Discussion  
15.30 CONSTIPATION NO ODS  

 State of art and EBM  
 Decision making: role of the 

gastroenterologist. 
 

 Constipation and 
hysterectomy: preventive 
surgery? 

 

 Colectomy or subtotal 
colectomy: we still need? 

 

 Constipation and NMS: first 
choise or salvage theraphy? 

 

 Discussion  
16.30 COFFEE BREAK  
17.00 INTERNAL RECTAL 

PROLAPSE 
 

 State of art and EBM  
 Internal rectal prolapse and 

urogynecological approach: 
we need a combinated 
theraphy? 

 

 Role of rectopexy: anterior or 
posterior? When and why? 

 

 Resective procedure: Internal 
rectal Delorme or STARR? 
When and why? 

 

 Resective or conservative 
treatment: what we need?  

 

 Discussion  
18.00 EXTERNAL RECTAL 

PROLAPSE 
 

 External rectal prolapse : 
state of art and EBM 

 

 Perineal stapled rectal 
resection  

 

 Frickman-Goldberg 
Operation  

 

 Altemeier Operation  
 Complete rectal and genital : 

combined theraphy 
 

 Discussion  
19.00  CHIUSURA LAVORI  
 



 

 
Conference Hall , 8 October  2010  
 
SESSION THREE 

 
 
orario TOPICS  
  08.30 Pelviperineal Mesh Surgery     

 State of art and EBM  
 Fascial reconstruction and 

mesh surgery: when and why?  
 

 Mesh surgery from a 
coloproctological point of view 

 

 Funcional results and sequele 
after mesh surgery : 
gynecological point of view 

 

 Mesh surgery and colorectal 
surgery  

 

 Discussion  
9.30 CONSULTANT’S CORNER  

UROGYNECOLOGY AND 
COLOPROCTOLOGY 

 

 Longo, Wexner, Nicholls  
 Meschia, Bernasconi, Cervigni  
 Discussion  

   
10.30 

COFFEE BREAK  

10.30 Live surgery: Surgeons   
 Case 1: Internal Rectal 

Prolapse + TVT 
 

 Case 2 : complete pelvic floor 
prolapse: combined resection 

 

 Case 3:NMS for double 
incontinence 

 

 Case 4: Transtar Procedure  
 Case 5: Total Prolift  
 Case 6: Pelvicol BARD  

14.00 LUNCH  
 



 

 
 

SESSION FOUR  
 

15,00 UROFAECAL 
INCONTINENCE 

 

 State of art and EBM  
 Coloproctological options  
 Urogynecological options  
 NMS and incontinence  
 Discussion  

16.30 COFFEE BREAK  
17,00 LAPAROSCOPY AND 

PELVIPERINEAL 
SURGERY 

 

 State of art and EBM  
 Pelvic suspension: options and 

modified anatomy 
 

 Role of deep Douglas pouch, 
enterocele and sygmoidocele 
on defecation  

 

 Laparoscopic hysterectomy 
and procedure to prevent 
pelvic floor disorders 

 

 Discussion  
18.00 CHIUSURA LAVORI  

 
 



 

 
 
Secondary Hall 7 October  2010 
Selected Oral Papers and Video  
 
SESSION ONE  

 
orario TOPICS  
08.30 IMAGING IN PELVIC 

FLOOR DISORDERS 
 

 Anal ultrasound: principles 
and indications 

 

 Rectal Ultrasound Staging  
 Perineal and translabial 

ultrasound 
 

 Cinedefecography: technique 
and indication 

 

 DefecoRMN: when and why?  
 Discussion  

10.30 COFFEE BREAK  
11.30 PROLASSO RETTALE  

 Discussion  
13.30 LUNCH  

 
 

SESSION TWO  
 

14.30 INCONTINENZA 
UROFECALE 

 

 Discussion  
16,30 COFFEE BREAK  
17.00 CHIRURGIA PROTESICA 

PELVIPERINEALE 
 

 Discussion  
18,30  CHIUSURA LAVORI  
 
Secondary Hall , 8 October  2010  
 
SESSION THREE 
 
orario TOPICS  
08.30 CONSTIPATION  

 Discussion  
09.30 DOLORE PELVICO 

CRONICO 
 

 Discussion  
10.30 COFFEE BREAK  

 
 

SESSION FOUR  
 

15,00 Riabilitazione  
 Discussion  

16.30 COFFEE BREAK  
16,30 Miscellanea  

 Discussion  
18,00 CHIUSURA LAVORI  

 
 
 
 
 


